
  

 

Data Technology Hub (DT Hub) Facts at a Glance 
 
Strategic Value 

• Accelerate Hong Kong’s data-led economic development with the provision of world-class 
infrastructure, attracting local and international data-intense companies, as well as top talent to co-
create data-driven innovative solutions 

• DT Hub is an ideal place to nurture a community of ICT companies, supporting them to turn their 
data assets into genuine value and competitive advantages in driving digital transformation   

• As the major initiatives supporting Hong Kong’s re-industrialisation drive, DT Hub and the adjacent 
Advanced Manufacturing Centre (AMC) provide an ideal environment for accelerating R&D and 
commercialisation with our world-class infrastructure tailored for business innovators in the 
innovation and technology ecosystem. The synergetic forces between the two projects will further 
propel the development of new industries  
 

Geographic Advantages 

• Strategically situated in the Tseung Kwan O industrial estate, which is home to Hong Kong’s largest 
and most advanced data centres supported by state-of-the-art data infrastructure 

• Adjacent to landing stations of major submarine cable systems, DT Hub is built with high-speed 
connectivity to any location around the world with minimal hops, high reliability and low latency 

• Upon its expected completion in 2022, the Cross Bay Link connecting Tseung Kwan O and Lam Tin 
Tunnel will reduce travel time by car to around 17 minutes to Central, and 8 minutes to Kwun Tong 
 

Features 

• A total gross floor area (GFA) of over 290,000 square feet, including a 220,000 square feet working 
space supporting tenants in developing data-driven solutions 

• With professional convention and exhibition areas, DT Hub allows companies to organise 
workshops, exhibitions, presentations and more, to further nurture industry collaboration and 
innovation 

• Designed with a floor loading of 5-7.5 kPa for heavy equipment installation 

• Designed with a minimum clear ceiling height of 3.5 metres and a 400mm raised floor for rack 
enclosures and uncluttered cable management 

• Rare dual power feeds to ensure highly substantial and reliable power supply 

• Air-conditioning and on-demand 24-hour chilled water supply (backed up by generator) to cool 
servers 

• Built-in exclusive trunk for on-demand set-up of fibre / copper transmission lines and dark fibre for 
powerful transmission 

 
Tenant support 

• Benefit from the comprehensive value-added services and support programmes within HKSTP’s 
ecosystem, including access to early-stage investment, technology, talent acquisition, business 
expansion 

• Access to one-stop support programmes, including Leading Enterprises Acceleration Programme 
(LEAP), Student Internship Programme, Accommodation Support, Global Acceleration Academy 
(GAA), among others 

Download images of DT Hub at https://bit.ly/2M9cCH4 
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